
24603 Federal Register / Vol. 90, No. 111 / Wednesday, June 11, 2025 / Notices 

Relevant outcome means the student 
outcome(s) or other outcome(s) the key 
project component is designed to 
improve, consistent with the specific 
goals of the program.’’ 

5. On page 91711, in the first column,
under Applicable Regulations, remove 
‘‘(e) The Supplemental Priorities.’’ 

6. On page 91711, in the first column,
under ‘‘Estimated Available Funds:’’, 
‘‘The Administration has requested 
$398,000,000 for GEAR UP for FY 2025, 
of which we intend to use an estimated 
$35,000,000 for the Partnership 
competition. The actual level of 
funding, if any, depends on final 
congressional action. However, we are 
inviting applications to allow enough 
time to complete the grant process if 
Congress appropriates funds for this 
program’’ to 

‘‘$36,500,000. Note: The Department 
is not bound by any estimates in this 
Notice.’’ 

7. On page 91712, in the second
column, ‘‘1. Application Submission 
Instructions’’ is corrected to read as 
follows: 

‘‘Applicants are required to follow the 
Common Instructions for Applicants to 
Department of Education Discretionary 
Grant Programs, published in the 
Federal Register on December 23, 2024 
(89 FR 104528), and available at https:// 
www.federalregister.gov/documents/ 
2024/12/23/2024-30488/common- 
instructions-for-applicants-to- 
department-of-education-discretionary- 
grant-programs.’’ 

8. On page 91712, in the third
column, under ‘‘Content And Form of 
Application Submission,’’ remove ‘‘and 
the competitive preference priorities’’. 
In the same column, remove ‘‘We 
recommend that any application 
addressing the competitive preference 
priorities include no more than three 
additional pages for each priority 
addressed.’’ 

9. On page 91715, in the first column,
‘‘Continuation Awards’’ is corrected to 
read as follows: 

‘‘6. Continuation Awards: In making a 
continuation award under 34 CFR 
75.253, the Secretary considers, among 
other things: whether a grantee has 
made substantial progress in achieving 
the goals and objectives of the project; 
whether the grantee has expended funds 
in a manner that is consistent with its 
approved application and budget; if the 
Secretary has established performance 
measurement requirements, whether the 
grantee has made substantial progress in 
achieving the performance targets in the 
grantee’s approved application, or 
whether the continuation of the project 
is in the best interest of the Federal 
Government. 

In making a continuation award, the 
Secretary also considers whether the 
grantee is operating in compliance with 
the assurances in its approved 
application, including those applicable 
to Federal civil rights laws that prohibit 
discrimination in programs or activities 
receiving Federal financial assistance 
from the Department (34 CFR 100.4, 
104.5, 106.4, 108.8, and 110.23).’’ 

Other Information 

Accessible Format: On request to the 
program contact persons listed under 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT, 
individuals with disabilities can obtain 
this document and a copy of the 
application package in an accessible 
format. The Department will provide the 
requestor with an accessible format that 
may include Rich Text Format (RTF) or 
text format (txt), a thumb drive, an MP3 
file, braille, large print, audiotape, 
compact disc, or other accessible format. 

Electronic Access to This Document: 
The official version of this document is 
the document published in the Federal 
Register. You may access the official 
edition of the Federal Register and the 
Code of Federal Regulations at 
www.govinfo.gov. At this site you can 
view this document, as well as all other 
Department documents published in the 
Federal Register, in text or Portable 
Document Format (PDF). To use PDF 
you must have Adobe Acrobat Reader, 
which is available free at the site. 

You may also access Department 
documents published in the Federal 
Register by using the article search 
feature at: www.federalregister.gov. 
Specifically, through the advanced 
search feature at this site, you can limit 
your search to documents published by 
the Department. 

Signing Authority 

This document of the U.S. 
Department of Education was signed on 
May 28, 2025, by Christopher J. 
McCaghren, ED.D, Acting Assistant 
Secretary Office of Postsecondary 
Education. That document with the 
original signature and date is 
maintained by the U.S. Department of 
Education. For administrative purposes 
only, and in compliance with 
requirements of the Office of the Federal 
Register, the undersigned has been 
authorized to sign the document in 
electronic format for publication, as an 
official document of the U.S. 
Department of Education. This 
administrative process in no way alters 

the legal effect of this document upon 
publication in the Federal Register. 

Tracey St. Pierre, 
Director, Office of the Executive Secretariat, 
Office of the Secretary, U.S. Department of 
Education. 
[FR Doc. 2025–10649 Filed 6–10–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

ELECTION ASSISTANCE COMMISSION 

Sunshine Act Meetings 

AGENCY: Election Assistance 
Commission. 
ACTION: Sunshine Act notice; notice of 
public meeting agenda. 

SUMMARY: Public Meeting: U.S. Election 
Assistance Commission Technical 
Guidelines Development Committee 
Virtual Meeting. 
DATES: Wednesday, July 2, 2025; 1–4 
p.m. ET. Written public comments must
be received no later than 5 p.m. ET on
June 27, 2025.
ADDRESSES: The virtual meeting is open
to the public and will be livestreamed
on the U.S. Election Assistance
Commission YouTube Channel: https://
www.youtube.com/channel/
UCpN6i0g2rlF4ITWhwvBwwZw.

Comments must be submitted in one 
of the following two ways (please 
choose only one of the ways listed): 

• Electronically at https://
www.regulations.gov (docket ID: EAC– 
2025–0010). Follow the ‘‘Submit a 
comment’’ instructions. If you are 
reading this document on 
federalregister.gov, you may use the 
green ‘‘SUBMIT A PUBLIC COMMENT’’ 
button beneath the Sunshine Act 
Meeting Notice title to submit a 
comment to the regulations.gov docket. 

• You may mail written comments to
the following address: U.S. Election 
Assistance Commission, 633 3rd Street 
NW, Suite 200, Washington, DC 20001. 
Mailed comments must be received by 
the close of the comment period. 

Do not include any personally 
identifiable information (such as name, 
address, or other contact information) or 
confidential business information that 
you do not want publicly disclosed. All 
comments are public records; they are 
publicly displayed exactly as received, 
and will not be deleted, modified, or 
redacted. Comments may be submitted 
anonymously. Follow the search 
instructions on https://
www.regulations.gov to view public 
comments. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Kristen Muthig, Telephone: (202) 897– 
9285, Email: kmuthig@eac.gov. 
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1 18 CFR 157.9. 

2 18 CFR 157.10(a)(4). 
3 18 CFR 385.211. 
4 Persons include individuals, organizations, 

businesses, municipalities, and other entities. 18 
CFR 385.102(d). 

5 18 CFR 385.2001. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Purpose: In accordance with the 

Government in the Sunshine Act 
(Sunshine Act), Public Law 94–409, as 
amended (5 U.S.C. 552b), the U.S. 
Election Assistance Commission (EAC) 
will hold a virtual meeting of the EAC 
Technical Guidelines Development 
Committee (TGDC) to conduct regular 
business. 

Agenda: The EAC and TGDC 
members will discuss the draft of the 
Voluntary Voting System Guidelines 
(VVSG) 2.1 and the Executive Order to 
Protect the Integrity of American 
Elections. There may be votes 
conducted at this meeting. The full 
agenda will be posted in advance on the 
EAC website at eac.gov/events. 

Background: Section 221 of the Help 
America Vote Act (HAVA) of 2002 (52 
U.S.C. 20971(b)) requires that the EAC 
to adopt voluntary voting system 
guidelines, and to provide for the 
testing, certification, decertification, and 
recertification of voting system 
hardware and software. 

The TGDC was established in 
accordance with the requirements of 
Section 221 of the Help America Vote 
Act of 2002 (Pub. L. 107–252, codified 
at 52 U.S.C. 20961), to act in the public 
interest to assist the Executive Director 
of the EAC in the development of 
Voluntary Voting System Guidelines. 

The TGDC is composed of 14 
members who are appointed jointly by 
the EAC and the National Institute of 
Standards and Technology (NIST). The 
committee, which the director of NIST 
chairs, was established to assist the EAC 
in developing VVSG in accordance with 
the Help America Vote Act of 2002. 

Status: This meeting will be open to 
the public. 

Camden Kelliher, 
General Counsel, U.S. Election Assistance 
Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2025–10679 Filed 6–9–25; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 4810–71–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP25–495–000] 

National Fuel Gas Supply Corporation; 
Notice of Application and Establishing 
Intervention Deadline 

Take notice that on May 20, 2025, 
National Fuel Gas Supply Corporation 
(National Fuel), 6363 Main Street, 
Williamsville, New York 14221, filed an 
application under section 7(c) of the 
Natural Gas Act (NGA) and Part 157 of 

the Commission’s regulations requesting 
authorization for its Beech Hill 
Boundary Modification (Project). 
National Fuel proposes to modify the 
reservoir and buffer boundaries of its 
Beech Hill Storage Complex, located in 
Allegany County, New York, and seeks 
authorization to use Well 7451 as a 
storage well. The project is designed to 
prevent further migration of storage gas 
and to allow National Fuel to fully 
access injected volumes, all as more 
fully set forth in the application which 
is on file with the Commission and open 
for public inspection. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
www.ferc.gov). From the Commission’s 
Home Page on the internet, this 
information is available on eLibrary. 
The full text of this document is 
available on eLibrary in PDF and 
Microsoft Word format for viewing, 
printing, and/or downloading. To access 
this document in eLibrary, type the 
docket number excluding the last three 
digits of this document in the docket 
number field. 

User assistance is available for 
eLibrary and the Commission’s website 
during normal business hours from 
FERC Online Support at (202) 502–6652 
(toll free at 1–866–208–3676) or email at 
ferconlinesupport@ferc.gov, or the 
Public Reference Room at (202) 502– 
8371, TTY (202) 502–8659. Email the 
Public Reference Room at 
public.referenceroom@ferc.gov. 

Any questions regarding the proposed 
project should be directed to Alice A. 
Curtiss, Chief Rates Counsel, National 
Fuel Gas Supply Corporation, 6363 
Main Street, Williamsville, New York 
14221, by phone at (716) 857–7075, or 
by email at curtissa@natfuel.com. 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure,1 within 90 days of this 
Notice the Commission staff will either: 
complete its environmental review and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding; or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or environmental assessment (EA) for 
this proposal. The filing of an EA in the 
Commission’s public record for this 

proceeding or the issuance of a Notice 
of Schedule for Environmental Review 
will serve to notify federal and state 
agencies of the timing for the 
completion of all necessary reviews, and 
the subsequent need to complete all 
federal authorizations within 90 days of 
the date of issuance of the Commission 
staff’s FEIS or EA. 

Public Participation 
There are three ways to become 

involved in the Commission’s review of 
this project: you can file comments on 
the project, you can protest the filing, 
and you can file a motion to intervene 
in the proceeding. There is no fee or 
cost for filing comments or intervening. 
The deadline for filing a motion to 
intervene is 5:00 p.m. Eastern Time on 
June 26, 2025. How to file protests, 
motions to intervene, and comments is 
explained below. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, community organizations, 
Tribal members and others, access 
publicly available information and 
navigate Commission processes. For 
public inquiries and assistance with 
making filings such as interventions, 
comments, or requests for rehearing, the 
public is encouraged to contact OPP at 
(202) 502–6595 or OPP@ferc.gov. 

Comments 
Any person wishing to comment on 

the project may do so. Comments may 
include statements of support or 
objections, to the project as a whole or 
specific aspects of the project. The more 
specific your comments, the more useful 
they will be. 

Protests 
Pursuant to sections 157.10(a)(4) 2 and 

385.211 3 of the Commission’s 
regulations under the NGA, any person 4 
may file a protest to the application. 
Protests must comply with the 
requirements specified in section 
385.2001 5 of the Commission’s 
regulations. A protest may also serve as 
a motion to intervene so long as the 
protestor states it also seeks to be an 
intervenor. 

To ensure that your comments or 
protests are timely and properly 
recorded, please submit your comments 
on or before June 26, 2025. 
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